
Marinette County
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

HIGHWAY DIVISION

      Mark A. Desotell Lynn Schingick
Director – Highway Commissioner                  Office Manager

Meeting of the Highway Committee
Wednesday, April 14, 2010

9:00 a.m.
Peshtigo Highway Office

Members Present: Chair Bousley, Vice Chair Sharpe, Supervisors Dill, Greason and Bauer

Others Present: DPW Director Desotell, Construction Supervisors Carl Meverden and Joe
Baranek, Al Sauld Town of Niagara Chairperson, Kellie Hartman and press

1. Meeting Called to Order
Meeting called to order by Chair Bousley at 9:00 a.m.

2. Approve Agenda
To approve the amended agenda with addendum as presented.  Motion (Greason/Sharpe) 
carried.  No negative vote.

3. Approve/Correction of Minutes
Motion (Bauer/Greason) to approve the March 30 & March 17, 2010 minutes as presented. Motion
 carried. No negative vote.

4. Public Comment
None

5. Traffic on CTH C & CTH O – Al Sauld Town of Niagara Chairperson     
Motion (Sharpe/Greason) to authorize Highway Commissioner Desotell to gather data on 
the intersection of CTH C & CTH O for a potential safety grant application and to contact 
WisDOT relative to potential intersection/corridor impacts resulting from the construction of 
the Niagara Bridge project. Motion carried. No negative vote.

6. Proposals for 2010 - 2012 furnishing hot mix & cold mix asphalt materials
One proposal was received for hot & cold mix asphalt materials. Motion (Bauer/Sharpe) to 
recommend to the County Board to approve the 2010 through 2012 proposal and 
purchase of hot & cold-mix asphalt materials production (FOB) from Northeast Asphalt, 
Inc. in the amount of $4,396,135 for the Highway Division of Public Works. Motion carried. 
No negative vote.

7. Proposals for 2010 furnishing pipe culvert materials
Three proposals were received for pipe culver materials (see page six for spreadsheet). 
Motion (Dill/Greason) to recommend to the County Board to approve the proposal and 
purchased of 2010 pipe culvert materials from Volm Bag Company, Inc. totaling 
$26,539.70 for the Highway Division of Public Works. Motion carried. No negative vote.
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8. Proposals for 2010 furnishing rubberized crack filling materials
Three proposals were received for crack filling materials. 

DEERY AMERICAN CORP No bid No bid
info@deeryamerican.com

Sealtight 3405

GERDAU AMERISTEEL $0.466 No bid
55 lbs per box     
36/Pallet

dflom@gerdauameristeel.com Sealtight 3405 22 Pallets

Crafco 201

SHERWIN INDUSTRIES $0.510 $0.560
35 lbs per box   
72/pallet

dmorgan@sherwinindustries.com 18 pallets

Crafco 702-0700
60 lbs per box   
32/pallet
18-20 pallets

MIDSTATES $0.4675 $0.595 Right Pointe 3405

midstates@midstatesequipment.net
60 lbs per box   
36/pallet
21 pallets

Right Pointe AC
60 lbs per box   
36/pallet
21 pallets

MARINETTE COUNTY HIGHWAY DIVISION

PRICES PER POUND
ASTM D3405      

CRAFCO 201 OR 
EQUIVALENT

ASTM D1190 
CRAFCO 702-

0700 OR 
EQUIVALENT

PACKAGING

2010 ASPHALT RUBBER SEALANT TABS

Motion (Bauer/Dill) to recommend to the County Board to approve the proposal and purchase of 
2010 rubberized crack filling materials from Midstates Equipment and Supply totaling $40,290 for 
the Highway Division of Public Works. Motion carried. No negative vote.

9. Proposals for 2010 furnishing geo-synthetic materials
Five proposals were received for geo-synthetic materials. 

CONSTRUCTION FABRICE & 
MATERIALS No Bid No Bid No Bid
sheila@cfmwi.com

EARTH & ROAD CORP $0.80 Daltex 1070 $3.50 BX1100 No Bid

DHOFFMAN@EARTHANDROAD.COM $0.85 Geotex 801 $5.50 BX1200 No Bid

ENVIRONMENTAL SAFETY GROUP $0.76 Geotex 701 $2.39
Tensar 

#100075 $2.33 TX140

jennifer@esgsafety.com $0.85 Geotex 801 $3.83
Tensar 

#120060 $3.95 TX160

ERO-TEX $0.80 Mirafi 170N $1.66
Tenax 

MS220B $1.66
Tenax 

MS220B

order@ero-tex.net $0.86 Mirafi 180N $2.78
Tenaz 
MS330 $2.78

Tenaz 
MS330

GEO-SYNTHETICS,LLC $0.80 Geotex 701 $2.20 BX1100 $2.20 TX140
sales@geo-synthetics.com $0.90 Geotex 801 $3.78 BX1200 $3.80 TX160

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES No Bid No Bid No Bid
dwerner@johndeerelandscapes.com

ZILLGES MATERIALS No Bid No Bid No Bid
oshkosh@zillges.com

GREEN BAY HIGHWAY PRODUCTS $0.68 Geotex 701 $2.25 BX1100 $2.20 TX140

gbhp@new.rr.com $0.78 Geotex 801 $3.55 BX1200 $3.65 TX160

PAYNTER EQUIPMENT No Bid No Bid No Bid
paynterequipment@frontiernet.net

Manf.

MARINETTE COUNTY HIGHWAY DIVISION
2010 GEOSYHTHETICS TABS

PRICES SY FT
Geotex          

701/801 or 
equivalent

Tensar          
BX1100/BX1200  

or equivalent

Tensar          
TX140/TX160  
or equivalentManf. Manf.

Motion (Bauer/Sharpe) to approve the proposal and purchase of 2010 geo-synthetic materials 
from Green Bay Highway Products for the Highway Division of Public Works. Motion carried. No 
negative vote.
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10. Proposals for 2010 furnishing silk fence
Three proposals were received for silk fence materials. 

CONSTRUCTION FABRICE & 
MATERIALS No Bid No Bid
sheila@cfmwi.com

EARTH & ROAD CORP $0.28 $0.28
DHOFFMAN@EARTHANDROAD.COM

ENVIRONMENTAL SAFETY GROUP No Bid No Bid
jennifer@esgsafety.com

ERO-TEX No Bid $0.30
order@ero-tex.net

GEO-SYNTHETICS,LLC $0.148 $0.2241
sales@geo-synthetics.com

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES No Bid No Bid
dwerner@johndeerelandscapes.com

ZILLGES MATERIALS No Bid No Bid
oshkosh@zillges.com

LINCOLN CONTRACTOR No Bid No Bid
brieckman@lincolncontractorssupply.com

GREEN BAY HIGHWAY PRODUCTS No Bid $0.2675

gbhp@new.rr.com

PAYNTER EQUIPMENT No Bid No Bid
paynterequipment@frontiernet.net

VOLM $0.1140 $0.1600

MARINETTE COUNTY HIGHWAY DIVISION

PRICES PER FT Econmy  3X100    
p.11 or equivalent

WisDOT  3X100    
p.13 or equivalent

2010 SILT FENCE TABS

Motion (Dill/Bauer) to the proposal and purchase of 2010 silk fence materials from Volm Company 
for the Highway Division of Public Works. Motion carried. No negative vote.

11.       Priority projects for STP Rural & Local Bridge Program as outlined by WisDOT on
 4/6 & 4/7 in Wausau @ the Highway Commissioner Training Workshop
DPW Director Desotell explained that staff and the committee will need to prioritize bridges 
within Marinette County for the STP Rural & Local Bridge Program. WisDOT has not 
solicited projects since 2007 due to the 2009 ARRA program. The STP program has been 
de-centralized from Madison to the oversight of the NE Region. Staff, from the NE Region, 
requested that project selections be identified and reviewed prior to May 31st, 2010. No 
action taken.

12. Final payment of county/state funds to be distributed to Village of Coleman for the 
reconstruction of CTH CP (former USH 141) within the village limits
Motion (Bauer/Greason) to recommend to the County Board to approve the final payment 
of county/state funds to be distributed for the reconstruction of CTH CP (former USH 141) 
to the Village of Coleman in the amount of $36,651 and to the Village of Pound in the 
amount of $13,376 subsequent to receipt by Marinette county of funds established by 
Amendment #3 of the Jurisdictional Transfer Agreement with WisDOT. Motion carried. No 
negative vote.

13. State/municipal agreement between WisDOT & Marinette County for the CTH A & W
project in the Village of Crivitz
No action taken.
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14. Proposed WCHA Constitutional AmendmentDPW Director Desotell explained the 
parameters of the proposed WCHA Constitutional Amendment and indicated that the 
WCHA by-laws grant the Highway Committee Chair or designee to vote on the 
amendment at the WCHA Summer Meeting. No action taken.

15.       Summer Highway Conference on June 7 – 9 2010 in Wisconsin Dells
Motion (Sharpe/Bauer) to authorize per diem and mileage reimbursement for any 
committee member attending the summer Highway Conference in Wisconsin Dells. Motion 
carried. No negative vote.

Supervisor Sharpe left at 10:50 a.m.

16. WCHA/WCA Capitol Days held on Monday, May 17, 2010
DPW Director Desotell explained the WCHA/WCA Capitol Days will be held on May 17, 
2010. No action taken.

17. Correspondences:
The Commissioner read and made available the correspondences listed on the agenda to 
the Committee Members for their review. DPW Director Desotell explained that Marinette 
County qualified for the first stage of the WE Energies Pike River Watershed Grant. 
Marinette County has been asked to submit a full application. No action taken.

18. Proposals for 2010 Furnishing Liquid Asphalt Materials
Two proposals were received for liquid asphalt materials.

VENDOR NAME HFRS-2 SC-250 MP 5 AE 90 ESTIMATED
APPLIED (FOB) (FOB) (FOB) COST

(Or Equivalent) (Or Equivalent) (Or Equivalent) (Or Equivalent)

Minimum Estimated Quantities 40,000 gallons 5,000 gallons 5,000 gallons 10,000 gallons

PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER 
GALLON GALLON GALLON GALLON

HENRY G. MEIGS, LLC $2.0460 $2.7338 $2.9388 $2.0260 $130,463.00

FLINT HILLS RESOURCES L.P. $1.8461 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PEARSON BROS., INC. $0.1800

$2.0261

Maximum Estimated Quantities 50,000 gallons 10,000 gallons 10,000 gallons 20,000 gallons

PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER 
GALLON GALLON GALLON GALLON

HENRY G. MEIGS, LLC $2.0460 $2.7338 $2.9388 $2.0260 $199,546.00

FLINT HILLS RESOURCES L.P. $1.8461 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PEARSON BROS., INC. $0.1800

$2.0261

Motion (Bauer/Greason) to recommend to the County Board to approve the proposal and 
purchase of 2010 liquid asphalt materials from H.G. Meigs, LLC totaling $199,546 for the 
Highway Division of Public Works. Motion carried. No negative vote.
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19. Revocable Occupancy Permits for Bank North and Betty Lou Rogalski as part of
                     CTH A & W STP Rural Project in Village of Crivitz  

Motion (Dill/Bauer) to recommend to the County Board to approve the Revocable 
Occupancy Permits for Bank North and Betty Lou Rogalski as part of the CTH A & W STP 
Rural Project #9258-05-71 in the Village of Crivitz. Motion carried. No negative vote.

20. Local Public Agency Certificate of R/W Acquisition to WisDOT for CTH A & W in the 
                     Village of Crivitz

Motion (Greason/Bauer) to approve the Local Public Agency Certificate of R/W Acquisition 
to WisDOT for CTH A & W Project #9258-05-71 in the Village of Crivitz. Motion carried. No 
negative vote.

21. Local Force Account Project ID 1491-13-60 on USH 141 for rubberized crack filling
                      and shouldering

Motion (Dill/Greason) to recommend to the County Board to approve the Local Force 
Account Project ID 1491-13-60 for rubberized crack filling and shouldering on USH 141 
between Wausaukee and Pembine in the amount of $84,157. Motion carried. No negative 
vote.

22. Highway Department report on activities.
Foremen Carl Meverden & Joe Baranek distributed a spreadsheet to explain what projects 
the employees were working on, along with how many hours spent on each project. 
Projects worked on were illegal sign removal in state right-of-way, patching, sign repairs, 
brush cutting and general maintenance.

23. Schedule of Vouchers
Motion (Greason/Dill) to approve the vouchers as presented.  Motion carried.  No negative 
vote. 

24. Next Meeting Date
The next meeting date will be on April 21, 2010 beginning at 11:00 a.m. in the Town of 
Athelstane with a road tour to follow.

25. Adjournment
Motion (Greason/Dill) to adjourn the meeting at 12:20 p.m.  Motion carried.
No negative vote.

Kellie Hartman/Assistant Office Manager
Date approved/corrected:
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SIZE SPECIFY VOLM PAYNTER GREEN BAY VOLM PAYNTER GREEN BAY VOLM PAYNTER GREEN BAY VOLM PAYNTER GREEN BAY
GAUGE PER FOOT PER FOOT PER FOOT 24" BAND 24" BAND 24" BAND 2-PIECE 24" BAND 2-PIECE 24" BAND 2-PIECE 24" BAND END WALL END WALL END WALL

15" 16 $7.86 $11.25 $13.10 $15.72 $22.50 $26.20 $17.29 $42.50 $26.20 $41.35 $60.50 $49.50

18" 16 $9.69 $13.39 $15.65 $19.38 $26.78 $31.00 $21.32 $47.78 $31.00 $53.59 $78.40 $81.50

21" 16 $11.10 $15.57 $18.20 $22.20 $31.14 $36.00 $24.42 $50.96 $36.00 $64.46 $94.35 $98.35

24" 16 $12.28 $17.66 $20.65 $24.56 $35.32 $42.00 $27.02 $54.12 $42.00 $79.96 $117.00 $121.80

30" 14 $19.58 $26.85 $31.35 $39.16 $53.70 $63.00 $40.08 $68.72 $63.00 $145.98 $213.65 $221.00

36" 14 $23.50 $32.12 $37.55 $47.00 $64.24 $75.00 $51.70 $77.26 $75.00 $235.28 $344.40 $357.00

42" 12 $37.21 $51.26 $59.90 $74.42 $102.52 $120.00 $81.86 $110.64 $120.00 $453.41 $649.60 $677.25

48" 12 $42.43 $58.54 $68.40 $84.86 $117.08 $139.00 $93.35 $125.94 $139.00 $514.75 $756.00 $792.00

54" 12 $47.66 $65.74 $76.80 $95.32 $131.48 $155.00 $104.85 $141.98 $155.00 $558.74 $896.00 $940.00

60" 10 $71.58 $91.16 $106.50 N/A $182.32 $215.00 $157.48 $195.92 $215.00 $918.20 $1,344.00 $1,418.00

72" 10 $85.48 $109.15 $127.50 N/A $218.30 $250.00 $188.06 $266.92 $250.00 $1,094.25 $1,601.60 $1,685.25

15" ADE 16 $8.52 $12.08 $14.85 $17.04 $24.16 $30.00 $18.75 Special Order $30.00 $41.59 $60.85 $63.00

18" ADE 16 $10.65 $14.23 $17.40 $21.30 $28.46 $35.00 $23.43 Special Order $35.00 $48.75 $71.35 $74.55

21" ADE 16 $12.21 $16.59 $20.65 $24.42 $33.18 $41.00 $26.86 Special Order $41.00 $59.33 $86.80 $90.30

24" ADE 16 $13.50 $18.84 $22.40 $27.00 $37.68 $45.00 $29.70 Special Order $45.00 $66.40 $102.25 $107.10

30" ADE 14 $21.56 $28.09 $31.35 $43.12 $56.18 $63.00 $47.43 Special Order $63.00 $115.44 $171.35 $178.50

36" ADE 14 $25.86 $33.47 $37.55 $51.72 $66.94 $75.00 $56.89 Special Order $75.00 $185.17 $271.00 $282.45

42" ADE 12 $40.93 $52.78 $59.90 $81.86 $105.56 $120.00 $90.05 Special Order $120.00 $319.05 $467.00 $488.25

48" ADE 12 $46.68 $60.18 $68.40 $93.36 $120.36 $140.00 $102.70 Special Order $140.00 $397.75 $582.40 $607.00

54" ADE 12 $51.85 $67.52 $76.80 $103.70 $135.04 $152.00 $114.07 Special Order $152.00 $553.12 $809.74 $845.00

60" ADE 10 $78.73 $98.13 $108.50 N/A $196.26 $220.00 $173.21 Special Order $220.00 $722.96 $1,058.40 $1,108.00

72" ADE 8 $94.57 $139.22 $129.51 N/A $278.44 $260.00 $208.06 Special Order $260.00 $1,040.50 $1,523.00 $1,543.50

ESTIMATED CULVERT MATERIALS FOR 2010 CONSTRUCTION
for

ANNULAR CORRUGATED RIVETED CULVERT PIPE
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