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SOLD AMOUNT   DESCRIPTION 

TOWN OF BEAVER 

$      850 T31N-R20E Sec. 25  1.01 acres.  Wooded vacant lot. Parcel #006-
01265.000 

$      100  T31N-R21E Sec. 18  0.67 acres.  Landlocked vacant lot. Parcel #006-
01535.001 

TOWN OF BEECHER 

$   3,900                        T36N-R20E Sec. 21.  1.98 acres.  W8188 Beecher Lake Road.  Mobile 
home in poor condition.  Parcel #008-00252.002 

$ 30,000                        T36N-R21E Sec. 24.  3.39 acres.  W4766 County Hwy Z.  Cabin and garage 
in good condition.  Parcel #008-00989.001 and Parcel #008-00993.000 

$      No Bid                   T36N-R21E Sec. 24.  0.27 acres.  Landlocked vacant lot.                         
Parcel #008-00989.014 

DUNBAR 

$    1,300 T36N-R19E Sec. 2.  1.04 acres.  Wooded, low ground lot.                            
Parcel #010-00387.004 

$       275                          T36N-R19E Sec. 27.  0.34 acres.  Landlocked narrow strip.                     
Parcel # 010-01044.001 

$     1,500 T37N-R19E Sec. 30.  0.44 acres.  Vacant empty lot.                                    
Parcel #010-02334.000                  

TOWN OF NIAGARA 

$      NO BID T38N-R20E Sec. 17.  0.02 acres.  Landlocked vacant lot.                         
Parcel #020-00601.012 

TOWN OF PEMBINE 

$  14,100 T36N-R20E Sec. 3.  5.43 acres.  W7916 Aspen Lane.  House and garage in 
fair condition.  Parcel #022-00081.001 

$ 41,000                        T37N-R20E Sec. 25.  28.50 acres.  Wooded parcel. Appears landlocked.                                                    
Parcel #022-00991.000 
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SOLD AMOUNT    DESCRIPTION 

TOWN OF PORTERFIELD 

$   1,300 T32N-R22E Sec. 26.  0.69 acres.  Wooded vacant lots.                           
Parcel #026-01241.000, Parcel #026-01250.001 and                             
Parcel #026-01250.002 

TOWN OF POUND 

$  25,500 T30N-R20E Sec. 4.  4.34 acres.  W9517 US Hwy 64.  Outbuildings in poor 
condition. Parcel #028-00046.006 

TOWN OF STEPHENSON 

$  21,500 T32N-R20E Sec. 29.  1.84 acres.  N6980 Loop Lake Road.  Home in fair 
condition with water damage in basement.  Parcel #032-02873.003 

$  18,500 T33N-R18E Sec. 32.  4.71 acres.  W13675 Thunder Mountain Road.  Old 
mobile home in poor condition.  Parcel #032-04145.000 

TOWN OF WAUSAUKEE 

$     150                          T33N-R21E Sec. 4.  1.01 acres. Landlocked narrow strip.                         
Parcel #036-00303.004 

$   3,500 T34N-R20E Sec. 3.  3.59 acres. Landlocked wooded lot.                         
Parcel #036-00580.000 

$       25                        T34N-R20E Sec. 10.  0.06 acres. Wooded lot.  Parcel #036-00718.005 

$   2,000  T34N-R20E Sec. 23.  1.08 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #036-01043.001 

CITY OF MARINETTE 

$   5,000                   T30N-R23E Sec. 12.  6.29 acres. Vacant, wooded lot.                              
Parcel #251-00574.000 

$     NO BID T30N-R24E Sec. 6.  0.06 acres.  Appears to be landlocked.                   
Parcel #251-02101.002 

$     NO BID                    T30N-R24E Sec. 6.  0.09 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-02378.000 
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MINIMUM BID    DESCRIPTION 

CITY OF MARINETTE CONTINUED 

$  25,000                       T30N-R23E Sec. 1.  0.13 acres.  1059 Walnut Street.  Old home in fair 
condition.  Parcel #251-02661.000 

$       100 T30N-R23E Sec. 1.  0.07 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-03307.000 

$  19,000 T30N-R24E Sec. 9.  0.19 acres.  226 Leonard Street.  Home in fair 
condition.  Parcel #251-04021.000 

$     1,250 T30N-R24E Sec. 8.  0.33 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-04059.000 

$       100 T30N-R24E Sec. 6.  0.05 acres.  1011 Cook Street.  Vacant lot.              
Parcel #251-04253.000 

$    1,800 T30N-R24E Sec. 8.  0.17 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-04741.000 

$    NO BID T30N-R24E Sec. 8.  0.28 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-04957.001 

$        25 T30N-R24E Sec. 8.  0.16 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-04995.000 

$      550 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.24 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05456.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.47 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05460.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.46 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05461.000 

$      500 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.36 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05462.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.34 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05463.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.44 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05464.000 

$      450 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.31 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05465.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.36 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05466.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.28 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05468.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.28 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05469.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.28 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05470.000 
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MINIMUM BID    DESCRIPTION 

CITY OF MARINETTE CONTINUED 

$      500 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.28 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05473.000 

$      300 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.28 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05474.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.26 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05476.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.25 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05477.000 

$      200 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.25 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05478.000 

$      400 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.26 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05479.000 

$      700 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.28 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05480.000 

$      600 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.28 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05481.000 

$ 10,000 T30N-R24E Sec. 6.  0.14 acres.  1012 Blaine Street.  Old home in fair 
condition.  Parcel #251-05896.000 

CITY OF NIAGARA 

$    NO BID T38N-R20E Sec. 15.  0.04 acres.  Vacant, narrow strip.                          
Parcel #261-00110.001 

$  14,000 T38N-R20E Sec. 9.  0.26 acres.  140 Dewey Court.  Old home in poor 
condition.  Parcel #261-00487.000 

$   5,500 T38N-R20E Sec. 15.  0.17 acres.  1649 Ridge Street.  Old home and garage 
in poor condition.  Parcel #261-01219.000 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


