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Highway Committee

Agenda

Wednesday, April 11", 2018
9:00 A.M.
Peshtigo Highway Shop

Call to order
Approve/amend agenda items
Approve/amend minutes of March 14™ 2018

Public Comment — Any person desirous to address the Committee on any subject under the
Committee’s jurisdiction shall first obtain permission from the Committee Chairperson.
All such addresses shall be limited to 5 minutes unless otherwise extended by the
Committee Chairperson.

Discuss/consider requests for opening up the following segments on County Highway to
ATV/UTV traffic as per County Ordinance 7.01 & 7.09 and recommend to County Board
approval of the following: Action if any.

= County Highway O beginning at Barlow Lake Road and ending approximately
5,673’ north of Barlow Lake Road

= County Highway H beginning at the west county line and ending at State Truck
Highway 8

= County Highway C beginning at County Highway | and ending at Boat Landing 11
Road

= County Highway K beginning at Pike River Road and ending at White Rapids Loop
West Road

= County Highway V beginning at Amberg Wausaukee Road and ending at County
Highway C

= County Highway C beginning at Palmer Road and ending at Northway Road

= County Highway X beginning at the north intersection of Deer Lake Road and
ending at Popps Lane

Discuss/consider responses for the following RFPs and recommend to the County Board
approval of the following purchases, action if any.

= 2018 2x4 One Ton Chassis Cab Dually
= Furnishing Pipe Culvert Materials

Discuss/consider forwarding uncollectible accounts in the amount of $181.19 to Finance
for Collections, action if any

Discuss/consider update on Sign Truck and Service Truck, action if any
Discuss/consider on asphalt paver control system, action if any

Discussion: meeting with WisDOT Secretary Ross. No action
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AGENDA



11. Correspondences
12.  Commissioner’s Report — Information only
13.  Review monthly invoices, no action
14.  Future agenda items
15. Discuss/consider next meeting date, action if any
16.  Adjourn
ADDENDUM(S) when applicable

Chair Shirley Kaufman Supervisor Joe Policello Supervisor Bill Stankevich
Supervisor Glenn Broderick Supervisor Mark Anderson

Note: Agenda items may not be considered and acted upon in the order listed. Supervisors present at
this meeting may constitute an unintended quorum of other county board committees. Supervisors
appointed to the committee shall participate in action. Others may be present to listen and observe.

If you are an individual who needs a special accommodation while attending the meeting as
required by the “Americans with Disabilities Act”, please notify the County Clerk, Marinette
County Courthouse (715-732-7406) at least 24 hours prior to the meeting in order to make
suitable arrangements. Thank you. (TDD 715-732-7760)
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Marinette County
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

MINUTES
Meeting of the Highway Committee
Wednesday, March 14, 2018
9:00 a.m.
Peshtigo Highway Office

Members Present:  Chair Shirley Kaufman, Supervisors Bill Stankevich, Glen Broderick and Mark
Anderson

Member Excused:  Supervisor Joe Policello
Others Present: Highway Commissioner Rick Rickaby, County Administrator John Lefebvre,
Accountant Hollie Viestenz, Assistant Finance Director Laura Mans, Greg
Reinhart, Terry Williams, Gary Jobelius, Bob White, Tiny Marcouiller, Mike
Mottes, Kellie Hartman and the Eagle Herald
1. Meeting Called to Order
Chair Kaufman called the meeting to order at 9:00 a.m.
2. Agenda
Commissioner Rickaby requested the Committee remove item #10 from the agenda because he and
the Sherriff’s Department had not both had an opportunity to review their safety findings together
regarding the proposed road segments. Motion (Kaufman/Stankevich) to approve the agenda as
amended. Motion carried.
3. Minutes of February 21%, 2018
Supervisor Broderick amended the minutes of February 21, 2018, item #9 - second motion to read
“to accept the recommendation of the Highway Commissioner and the Sherriff’s Department to deny
approval of the following segments due to safety concerns”. Motion (Stankevich/Kaufman) to
approve the minutes of February 21%, 2018 as amended. Motion carried.

4. Public Comment

Greg Reinhart — President of Ranger City Riders — CTH V & C, CTH K segments
Terry Williams — clubs willing to work together regarding safety issues

5. Election of Committee Vice Chair

Motion (Broderick/Kaufman) to elect Bill Stankevich as Committee Vice Chairperson. Motion
carried.
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Marinette County Highway Committee
March 14, 2018
Page 2

Informational: 2017 Highway Year End Financial Report

Accountant Hollie Viestenz presented 2017 Highway Financial Report. Discussion only.
Commissioner Rickaby — Power Point presentation — 2017 Highway Operations. Discussion only.

. Transfer of $13,873.99 from general maintenance to county winter maintenance

Motion (Anderson/Stankevich) to approve the transfer of $13,873.99 from account #53301000
(county general maintenance) to account #53302000 (county winter maintenance) with
recommendation to Finance Committee. Motion carried.

. Transfer $169,261.74 from the 2016 CIP funds to special revenue for project CTH G

Motion (Stankevich/Broderick) to approve the transfer of $169,261.74 from account #57002751-
52751 (2016 CIP fund) to #53305000 (special revenue account) for the state-administered project on
CTH G with recommendation to Finance Committee. Motion carried.

Responses for the following RFPs and recommend to the County Board approval of the
following (contract language pending Corporation Counsel review):

Motion (Anderson/Stankevich) to recommend County Board award bid in accordance with RFP # 18-
18-30 and approve entering into an agreement, subject to Corporation Counsel review, with Northeast
Asphalt, Inc. to furnish hot and cold mix asphalt materials for 2018. Motion carried.

Motion (Broderick/Anderson) to recommend County Board award bid in accordance with RFP # 18-
16-30 to Henry G. Meigs, LLC for Deery 80102 GL at $0.4154/1b. for an approximate quantity of
40,000 Ibs. of material at a cost of $16,616.00. Motion carried.

Motion (Kaufman/Broderick) to recommend County Board award bid in accordance with RFP # 18-
17-30 to Henry G. Meigs, LLC for Deery 80101 GL at $0.4789/Ib. for an approximate quantity of
40,000 Ibs. of material at a cost of 19,156.00. Motion carried.

Motion (Stankevich/Anderson) to recommend County Board award bid in accordance with RFP # 18-
15-30 to Henry G. Meigs, LLC for MS-2 delivered at $2.0974/gal. for an approximate quantity of
20,000 gal at a cost of $41,948.00 and to award bid and enter into an agreement, subject to
Corporation Counsel review, with Henry G. Meigs, LLC for HFRS-2 material and application at
$2.2474/gal, total cost dependent on State and local demands. Motion carried.

Motion (Kaufman/Stankevich) to recommend County Board award bid and approve entering into an
agreement, subject to Corporation Counsel review, with Tri-County Paving for 2018 pulverizing at
$0.280/s.y. for an approximate 90,000/s.y at a cost of $25,200.00 and to authorize the Commissioner
to utilize the next lowest bidder in the event of a scheduling conflict with Tri-County paving and enter
into agreement, subject to Corporation Counsel review, with the next lowest bidder if Tri-County
Paving’s is unavailable to perform the services in a timely fashion. Motion carried.

501 Pine Street — Peshtigo, WI — Phone 582-3771 — Fax 582-4348-www.marinettecounty.com
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Marinette County Highway Committee
March 14, 2018
Page 3

Motion (Kaufman/Broderick) to recommend County Board award bid as identified in RFP # 18-20-30
and approve entering into an agreement, subject to Corporation Counsel review, with Northeast
Asphalt for 2018 pulverizing and milling dependent on needs and to authorize the Commissioner to
utilize the next lowest bidder in the event of a scheduling conflict with Northeast Asphalt and enter
into an agreement, subject to the Corporation Counsel review, with the next lowest bidder if Northeast
Asphalt is unavailable to perform the services within a timely fashion. Motion carried.

Discussion: mixed sand pile cover

Mixed sand pile cover doesn’t justify the cost. Discussion only.

Adopt-a-Highway County Policy

Discussion only.

Discussion: Parcels 1 & 2 (41 Wayside)

Parcels 1 & 2 (41 Wayside). Discussion only

Correspondence.

None

Informational: Commissioner’s report

The Commissioner reported the crews completed crack sealing on CTH P and began crack sealing on
Tho Spring Weight Restiction weng into 21toct on MArch L1, 2018, "o oo 1epar for the state
Invoices

Committee reviewed the invoices totaling $290,905.05.

Future Agenda Items

ATV/UTV Ordinance

Next Meeting Date.

The next meeting will be on April 11", 2018 beginning at 9:00 a.m. at the Peshtigo Highway Shop.
Adjourn

Motion (Kaufman/Stankevich) to adjourn the meeting at 11:00 a.m. Motion carried.

Kellie Hartman
Administrative Assistant
Date approved/correct

501 Pine Street — Peshtigo, WI — Phone 582-3771 — Fax 582-4348-www.marinettecounty.com
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ATTACHMENT A

RFP#18-018-30
FURNISHING HOT & COLD MIX ASPHALT MATERIALS
BID TABULATION SHEET

Asphalt Plant Location Pm nal wT

3LT 58285 P4y, 5 /Ton
41T 58-28 S $ 43.%5 /Ton
51T 58-28 $ HbL,15 /Ton
3LT 58-34S $ Hip, 1B /Ton
AT 58-34 5 £ U AN /Ton
51T 58345 4 Ki.15 /Ton
3MT 58-28 S $ H3,15 /Ton
4MT 58-285 4 45,35 [Ton
5MT58-28S 4 4%. 45  sron
3MT58-34 5 ¢ 41,55  sron
AMT58-34'S $ 19 .15 rron
5MT 58-34 5 $ Bleleh _ fTon

Cold Mix Asphalt Patching Material

Plant Location phur\.n} — T

Price Per Ton Mixing and Aggregate Only :ﬁ’ﬁ’ll e

I, LP(ZI(‘,)ﬂ\ , have full authority to make such statements and to
submit this as the duly recognized representative of the Proposer.

/ A-a8-1%

Sigfil:;j’;c Mv Authorized Individual Date

printedName: _Jap Lealh . Title: Qgef\‘ﬁ
Business Name: _Northenst Asphalt Tne ,
Address: 15349 Al nson Qr;, (reen B{u,f. L 54303

Page 8

Phone Number: ng. ‘-M‘-\ - i}"')q 3 Email: » J
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MARINETTE COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
2018 HOT APPLIED JOINT & CRACK SEALANTS

CRAFCO 201 or | Semi load Price | CRAFCO 231 or | Semiload Price
VENDOR Proven Equal 40,000 Lbs Proven Equal 40,000 Lbs
$0.4154 Ib $0.4789 Ib
Henry G. Meigs, LLC Deery 80102 GL $16,616.00 Deery 80101 GL. $19,156.00
$0.42 Ib $0.459 Ib
Right Pointe 3405 Right Pointe 3405
Midstates Equipment & Supply, Inc. Rubber $16,800.00 Modified $18,360.00
Sherwin Industries, Inc. $.437018 $17,480.00 $.479 LB $19,160.00

AGENDA




MARINETTE COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
2018 LIQUID ASPHALT MATERIALS

HFRS-2 HFRS-2 HFRS-2 Ms-2 MS-2
50,000 - 100,000 gal 50,000 - 100,000 gal Material and 20,000 gal 20,000 gal
VENDOR MATERIAL Application Application Total MATERIAL ONLY DELIVERED
Jff Schu T15-311.2563 No bid | No bid No bid
$0.420 / gal §2.33 / gal
Flint Hills Resources Randy 1,91 gal

Hollad

Henry G. Meigs
Jack Yates 800-362-1440

$2.0974 gal

$0.15 / gal

$2.2474 / gal

$2.0250 gal

$2.0974 gal
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MARINETTE COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
2018 ROADWAYS PULVERIZATION

PULVERIZE ONLY| 0"-3" GRAVEL 4"-6" GRAVEL 7'-8' 7-8 3'-4' 34
ESTIMATED UNIT INCREASE INCREASE MILLING HR MILLING HR MILLING HR MILLING HR
VENDOR QIY (S.Y.) PRICE (S5.Y.) PRICE {5.Y.) PRICE {5.Y} W/ CLEAN UP | NO CLEAN UP | W/ CLEAN UP | NO CLEAN UP -Contact 8& Phone No.
HEIN RECLAMATION & CONST. INC 90,000 $0.320 $0.00 $0.02 $950.00 $800.00 NG BID NO BID JAMES HEIN (920} 498-4095

PO BOX 12614 GREEN BAY, W 54307-2614 L

TRI-COUNTY PAVING, INC 50,000 $0.280 $0.000 $0.000 $1,246.00 $852.00 NO BID NO BID DUSTIN GRABEL {608) 846-4657
PO BOX 394 DEFOREST, WI 53532
THE KRAMER COMPANY LLC 90,000 $0.291 $0.02 $0.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID CCDY CHURCHILL (608) 432-5761
82 WACHTER AVENUE PLAIN, W| 53577 :
Northeast Asphalt 20,000 50.288 $0.02 50.03 $530.00 5765.00 $675.00 $475.00 JON LEACH {520} 494-0543
1524 ATKINSON DRIVE GREEN BAY, WI 54303 N
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2018 2 x 4 (1) TON CHASSIS CAB DUALLY

Ewald's Automotive Group Ewald’s Automotive Group The Motor Company
BIDDER Oconomowoc, WI Oconomowaoc, WI Marinette, Wi
YEAR 2015 2018 2015
MAKE FORD DODGE FORD
MODEL F350 RAM 3500 F350 Chassis Cab
TRIM PACKAGE XLT Tradesman XL 2x4
$35108.50 + 527.5.00 for PTO $33155.50 + 55.38.0.00 for PTO $36,704.00
PRICE provision provision
TOTAL $35,383.50 $33,735.50 $36,704.00
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3/15/18 10:14:55
VEND# NAME
00516 AMERI CAN VEELDI NG & GAS | NC

00549 MONRCE TRUCK EQUI PMENT, | NC

00587 PACKER CI TY | NTERNATI ONAL

00593 ADVANCE AUTO PARTS

H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT

| NV#
05423506

787412

X10108217901

X10108218301

X10108271601

X10108276401

X10108283001

X10108295101

X10108341601

2825 377201

DATE
3/ 08/ 18

3/08/18

2/ 15/ 18

2/ 13/ 18

2/ 26/ 18

2/ 23/ 18

2/ 26/ 18

2/27/18

3/08/18

3/07/18

ACCT# P/SIU OBJ

53230 000 490
53230 000 490

Wr

000
000

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

*VENDOR TOTALS*

53240 61 453

203

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

*VENDOR TOTALS*

16112 000
16112 000

000
000

*I NVO CE TOTALS*

53240 196 453

203

*I NVO CE TOTALS*

53240 193 453

203

*I NVO CE TOTALS*

53240 197 453
16112 000

203
000

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

53240 189 453

203

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

53240 189 453

203

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

53240 193 453
53240 193 453
53240 193 453

203
203
203

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

*VENDOR TOTALS*

16112 000
16112 000
16112 000

000
000
000

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

AGENDA

AMOUNT

33.
107.

140.
140.
125.
125.
125.

21.
157.

178.
1374.
1374.

38.
38.

79.
184.

263.
365.
365.
185.
185.
351.
42.
18.
411.
68.
18.
17.
10.

46.

57
33

90
90
17
17
17

06
44

50
26-
26-
03
03

36
26

62
32
32
75
75
10
07
30
47
43
49
46
28

23

PAGE 1
| TEM #

OXYGEN
ACETYLENE

5L COMPRSSR O L

PCl 27578R1
PCl 2592437C91

GEAR ASM STEERN

BRACKET CTR BRG

ARMWS WPER L
PCl 5676X

MJUFFLER OVAL T5

STRAP MUFFLER

TANK DEAERATI ON
CABLE ASSY SRG
CAP RAD FI LLER

CAQVEGL50
CAQVEG200
CAQVEG250

NWw

. 00

. 00
.00

. 00-

.00

.00
. 00

. 00

. 00

. 00
.00
. 00

. 00
.00
. 00



3/15/18 10:14:55
VEND# NAME

00598 POW' S TI RE SERVI CE

00943 WTT' S PIGAY WGEY

01285 ULINE I NC

01554 W DEPT OF TRANSPORTATI ON

H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT

| NV# DATE
2825 377327 3/ 09/ 18
2825 377344 3/ 09/ 18
2825 377364 3/ 09/ 18
2825 377490 3/12/18
2825 377501 3/12/18
670022903 3/06/18
670022950 3/ 06/ 18
670023264 3/ 06/ 18
C0180 8253 3/ 08/ 18
95477611 3/06/18
395000007567  2/21/18

ACCT# P/SIU OBJ
16112 000

*I NVO CE TOTALS*

53240 85 453

*I NVO CE TOTALS*

53240 85 453
53240 85 453

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

53240 200 453

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

53240 85 453

*I NvO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*

53240 201 453
53240 191 453

*I NVO CE TOTALS*

53240 419 453

*I NVO CE TOTALS*

53240 464 453

*I NVO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*

53230 000 490
53230 000 490

*I NvO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*

53230 000 462

*I NvO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*

53315 920 470

*I NvO CE TOTALS*

*VENDOR TOTALS*
AGENDA

Wr

000

203

203
203

203

203

203
203

203

203

000
000

000

000

AMOUNT
25. 38
25. 38

129.58

129.58

57.32
86. 29

143. 61
21.62
21.62
31. 84
31. 84

398. 26

475. 83
988. 02

1463. 85
173. 00
173. 00
205. 00
205. 00

1841. 85

1.99
55. 96

57.95
57.95
396. 21
396. 21
396. 21
10813. 82
10813. 82
10813. 82

PAGE 2

| TEM #

| NA3976

ENG O L COOL LN

BRK PAD FRONTLN
Pl TVAN ARM

ON DEF457

BRK PAD PLAT

ALC 22.5X12. 05
TRK ST225X1225

SRV CALL

SRVC CALL

3PK AXE HAND WD
55GL TRSH BGS

STEP STOOLS

T LAKE CTH G

MHGR2065
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3/15/18 10:14:55 H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT PAGE 3 MHGR2065

VEND# NAME I NV# DATE ACCT# P/SIU OBJ wWr AMOUNT | TEM # qQry
01568 W SCONSI N KENWORTH (006446 3/06/18 53240 201 453 203 90. 00 EXHST BRK HNGR 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 90.00 *
@06717 3/07/18 16112 000 000 58. 35 TRE698097 5.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 58.35 *
@006745 3/07/18 53240 193 453 203 3.74 SEAL GROMMET 2.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 3.74 *
3006882 3/08/18 53240 203 453 203 28.72 TUBE VENT 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 28.72 *
G907083 3/09/18 16112 000 000 799. 30 NEV3920 10. 00
16112 000 000 49. 32 NEVO4247TLT 6.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 848.62 *
(3007181 3/09/18 53240 193 453 203 95. 84 FLEXBL HOSE 1.00
53240 193 453 203 6.82 UNION, MALE 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 102.66 *
&007192 3/09/18 16112 000 000 21.72 TRE10202R 12.00
16112 000 000 29. 60 BAT67050 20. 00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 51.32 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 1183.41 * *
01635 CRI VI TZ AUTO PARTS 14546 135308 3/07/18 53240 61 453 203 12.78 QL FILTER 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 12.78 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 12.78 * *
01740 PLYMOUTH LUBRI CANTS 6164304 3/13/18 53240 204 453 203 17.80 TERRA CAl RE DEF 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 17.80 *
6164306 3/13/18 53240 422 453 203 11.07 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 198 453 203 11. 07 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 199 453 203 11. 07 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 200 453 203 11. 06 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 201 453 203 11. 07 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 202 453 203 11. 06 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 203 453 203 11. 07 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 204 453 203 11. 06 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 205 453 203 11. 07 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 206 453 203 11. 06 TERRA CAl RE DEF
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3/15/18 10:14:55 H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT PAGE 4 MHGR2065

VEND# NAME I NV# DATE ACCT# P/SIU OBJ wWr AMOUNT | TEM # qQry
53240 207 453 203 11. 07 TERRA CAl RE DEF
53240 208 453 203 11.07 TERRA CAl RE DEF
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 132.80 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 150.60 * *
01948 UNI FI RST CORPORATI ON 0982052348 3/08/18 53270 001 291 000 45. 68 VATS 3X10 6.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 45.68 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 45.68 * *
02233 WALT' S PETROLEUM SERVI CE | NC 93402 62291 3/02/18 53232 000 291 000 3581. 60 SERVI CE WORK
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 3581.60 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 3581.60 * *
02560 COMPASS M NERALS 208855 3/01/18 16170 000 000 5346. 30 SALT 1 75.30
53250 000 960 000 447. 28- SALT 1
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 4899.02 *
209516 3/02/18 16170 000 000 56418.73 SALT 1 794. 63
53250 000 960 000 4720. 10- SALT 1
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 51698.63 *
210257 3/05/18 16170 000 000 3619. 58 SALT 1 50. 98
53250 000 960 000 302. 82- SALT 1
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 3316.76 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 59914.41 * *
03978 GREEN BAY H GHWAY PRODUCTS 31607 2/28/18 16111 000 000 3652. 00 GBHGRL 20. 00
16111 000 000 913. 00 BARGR 10. 00
16111 000 000 4750. 00 GBHSKT350 2.00
53230 000 490 000 724.50 POST BOLTS 150. 00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 10039.50 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 10039.50 * *
04893 CENTURYLI NK 301434828 C8  3/03/18 53230 000 225 000 112.18 PEMBI NE SHOP
53270 003 229 000 74.79 PEMBI NE DSL
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 186.97 *
301435146 8C  3/03/18 53232 000 225 000 62. 90 PEMBI NE FUEL
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 62.90 *
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3/15/18 10:14:55
VEND# NAME

05627 MAR- OCO LANDFI LL

H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT
I NV# DATE ACCT# P/SIU OBJ wWr

301547425 8C  3/03/18 53321 024 470 064
53270 002 229 000

*I NVO CE TOTALS*
301548162 8C  3/03/18 53232 000 225 000
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*
1471 030118 3/01/18 53311 000 470 300
53321 031 470 054
53311 000 470 300
*I NVO CE TOTALS*

*VENDOR TOTALS*

* * FINAL TOTALS * *

AGENDA

AMOUNT

142.
83.

226.
62.
62.

539.
16.
12.

.27

35.

35.

89345.

88
92

80
90
90
57
53
54
34
34

48

PAGE 5
| TEM #

CRIV SHP & FAX
CRI VI TZ DSL

CRI VI TZ FUEL

31322 COMVRCL
31614 COMVRCL
31614 COMVRCL

MHGR2065

.29
.22
11



3/ 22/ 18 14:31:47
VEND# NAME
00587 PACKER CI TY | NTERNATI ONAL

H G-VWAY COWM TTEE APPROVAL REPORT

I NV# DATE ACCT#
X10108341601 3/ 12/ 18 53240
53240

53240

P/S/IU  OBJ
186 453
186 453
186 453

WIr

203
203
203

*1 NvO CE TOTALS*

* * FINAL TOTALS *

AGENDA

*VENDCOR TOTALS*

*

AMOUNT

328.
52.
31.

411.

411.

411.

15-
21-
11-
47-

47-

47-

PAGE 1 MHGR2065
| TEM # Qry
TANK DEAERATI ON

CABLE ASSY SURG
CAP RAD FI LLER



3/ 29/ 18 9:42: 46 H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT PAGE 1 MHGR2065

VEND# NAME I NV# DATE ACCT# P/SIU OBJ wWr AMOUNT | TEM # qQry
00191 SUPERI OR CHEM CAL CORPORATI ON 188583 3/ 22/ 18 53230 000 490 000 66. 02 NI TRI LE EXAM GL 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 66.02 *
188584 3/ 22/ 18 53230 000 490 000 1224. 28 HRNT VEG SPRY 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 1224.28 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 1290.30 * *
00236 ALL-LIFT SYSTEMS I NC 0388280 IN 3/ 20/ 18 53220 000 490 000 526. 75 CHNSW CHPS 33" 5.00
53220 000 490 000 316. 05 CHNSW CHPS 36" 3.00
53220 000 490 000 217. 38 CHNSW CHPS 39" 2.00
53220 000 490 000 328. 24 HRD HAT SYSTM 8.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 1388.42 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 1388.42 * *
00285 GRAI NGER 815560206 9734735781 3/21/18 53220 000 490 000 273.60 COLD PRTCTN GLV 18. 00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 273.60 *
9735451636 3/22/18 53230 000 490 000 31. 96 SPRI NG NUT 1/ 4" 2.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 31.96 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 305.56 * *
00546 M LLER BRADFORD & RI SBERG I NC P03045 3/20/18 53240 504 453 203 1067. 10 FLAT FLASH NG
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 1067.10 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 1067.10 * *
00648 MENOM NEE | NDUSTRI AL SUPPLY 10450180 3/26/18 53240 129R 453 203 6.32 SPARK PLUG 2.00
53240 129R 453 203 31.98 CABLE SPRK PLG 2.00
53240 129R 453 203 56. 38 STATOR 1.00
53240 129R 453 203 34.71 SW TCH KEY 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 129.39 *
10451403 3/26/18 16112 000 000 3.68 MES6MJ 6 MP 6. 00
16112 000 000 5.19 MES8MJ8MP 6.00
16112 000 000 8.63 MES8MI 8MP45 6. 00
53240 233 453 203 92. 29 | SO-FF CPLR-1 1.00
53240 233 453 203 42.05 I SO FF N PP-1 1.00
16112 000 000 1388. 79 MESJ404 550. 00
16112 000 000 52.24 MES16Gl6FIX 3.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 1592.87 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 1722.26 * *

AGENDA



3/ 29/ 18 9:42: 46

VEND# NAME
01016 BEAVER MACHI NE I NC

01111 RUBBER | NC

01568 W SCONSI N KENWORTH

01635 CRI VI TZ AUTO PARTS

01722 SERVE | MPLEMENT MUNI CPAL SALES

01948 UN FI RST CORPCRATI ON

02408 GARROW O L CORP

H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT

I NV#
| N78297

043202

(009495

(009519

14546 135909

4897

4913

098 2054120

756421

DATE
3/ 22/ 18

3/21/18

3/ 27/ 18

3/ 27/ 18

3/ 22/ 18

3/23/18

3/ 27/ 18

3/ 22/ 18

3/13/18

ACCT# P/ SI'U
53240 435A
53240 435A
53240 435A

*I NV CE

*VENDOR
53230 000
53230 000
53230 000

*I NV CE

*VENDOR
16112

*I NV CE
16112

*I NV CE

*VENDOR

53240 261
53240 261

*1 NvVO CE
*VENDOR
53240 232BC
53240 232BC
53240 232BC
53240 232BC
*I NvO CE
53240 239BC
*I NvO CE
*VENDOR
53270 001
*I NvO CE
*VENDOR
16113

*I NvO CE

oBJ Wr
453 203
453 203
453 203
TOTALS*
TOTALS*
490 000
490 000
490 000
TOTALS*
TOTALS*
000 000
TOTALS*
000 000
TOTALS*
TOTALS*

453 203
453 203

TOTALS*
TOTALS*
453 203
453 203
453 203
453 203
TOTALS*
453 203
TOTALS*
TOTALS*
291 000
TOTALS*
TOTALS*
000 000

TOTALS*

VB AGENDA

AMOUNT
92.35
67.38
30. 42

190. 15

190. 15
52.53
16. 98
74.09
74.09
29. 26
29. 26
14. 63-
14. 63-
14. 63
30.75

35.81
35.81
88. 96
97. 25
198. 38
41. 45
426. 04
390. 61
390. 61
816. 65
45. 00
45. 00
45. 00
16776. 15
16776. 15

16776. 15

PAGE 2
| TEM #
TOOTH OQUT

TOOTH I N
LOCK STRI P

DI LL USA BLK GU
GP 4I N1 VLV
ML 1X718 1D BR

PCl CR1743

PCl CR1743

AR
SPARK PLUG

TUBE #304
TUBE #305
TUBE #307
SEAL CVR TO BDY

SPI NDLE 5/ 8HOLE

MATS

82

MHGR2065

NN

20.

7399.

NRPE

.00
. 00
.00

.00
. 00
00

.00

. 00-

.00
. 00

00
00
00
00

.00

.00

00



3/ 29/ 18 9:42: 46
VEND# NANE
04893 CENTURYLI NK

H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT
I NV# DATE ACCT# P/SIU OBJ wWr
301525992C18  3/17/18 53321 024 470 064
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*

* * FINAL TOTALS * *

AGENDA

AMOUNT
50. 39
50. 39
50. 39

23776.51

PAGE
| TEM #
MNKNEE

BRDG

MHGR2065



4/05/18 11:00: 20 H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT PAGE 2 MHGR2065

VEND# NAME I NV# DATE ACCT# P/SIU OBJ wWr AMOUNT | TEM # qQry
53240 504 453 203 251.76 PLATE BEARI NG 1.00
53240 504 453 203 584. 24 FL BEARI NG 2.00
53240 504 453 203 6.02 CAPSCREW 8.00
53240 504 453 203 5.19 COTTER PIN 6.00

*I NVO CE TOTALS* 6123.72 *
002839 4/ 02/ 18 53240 504 453 203 311.76 CONE FLAME 2.00

*I NVO CE TOTALS* 311.76 *
002846 4/02/18 53240 150 453 203 142. 27 S| DE RUBBER 2.00
53240 150 453 203 11.13 SOCKET 20. 00

*I NVO CE TOTALS* 153.40 *

*VENDOR TOTALS* 6588.88 * *
00549 MONRCE TRUCK EQUI PMENT, | NC 42102 3/26/18 53280 209 890 000 116882.00 TRUCK ACCESSCRI

*I NVO CE TOTALS* 116882.00 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 116882.00 * *

00576 DRI FTWOOD SPORT FUEL 1013680 3/28/18 53321 001 470 002 37. 45 LP 20# 2.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 37.45 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 37.45 * *
00593 ADVANCE AUTO PARTS 2825 377375 3/09/18 53240 87 453 203 229.67- ALTERNATOR 1. 00-
53240 201 453 203 37. 39- POLY RIB BELT 1. 00-
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 267.06- *
2825 377672 3/ 14/18 53230 000 462 000 13.01 BAND WRENCH 2.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 13.01 *
2825 378343 3/22/18 53240 15 453 203 27.91 ATF DEX VI 4.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 27.91 *
2825 378450 3/23/18 53230 000 490 000 7.20 GASKET MAKER 1.00
53230 000 490 000 7.20 ULTI MATE 1.00
53230 000 490 000 24.32 THREAD LOCK BLU 2.00
53230 000 490 000 24. 33 THREAD LOCK RED 2.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 63.05 *
2825 378671 3/26/18 16112 000 000 8.92 | NA84202 2.00
16112 000 000 7.55 | NA84620 2.00
16112 000 000 28. 47 | NA96112 1.00

AGENDA



4/05/18 11:00: 20 H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT PAGE 3 MHGR2065

VEND# NAME | NV# DATE ACCT# P/SIU OBJ wWr AMOUNT | TEM # qQry
16112 000 000 39. 09 | NA3960 2.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 84.03 *
2825 378843 3/ 28/ 18 53230 000 490 000 30.75 BAT TERM PROTEC 6. 00
53230 000 490 000 4.32 FORM A GASKET 1.00
53230 000 490 000 6.51 THREAD 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 41.58 *
2825 378854 3/ 28/ 18 53240 504 453 203 28. 65 SERP BELT 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 28.65 *
2825 378880 3/ 28/ 18 53240 15 453 203 94. 63 TRANS LI NE 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 94.63 *
2825 379200 4/ 02/ 18 53240 500 453 203 20.92 AIR FILTER 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 20.92 *
2825 379201 4/02/18 16112 000 000 20.93 | NAG562 1.00
16112 000 000 56. 59 I NA2795 3.00
16112 000 000 42.53 | NA2794 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 120.05 *
2825 379242 4/ 02/ 18 53240 15 453 203 87.31 BLOAER MOTOR 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 87.31 *
2825 379283 4/03/18 53240 131 453 203 8.92 AL FILTER 2.00
53240 131 453 203 12. 00 AR FILTER 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 20.92 *
2825 379395 4/ 04/ 18 53240 504 453 203 24. 65 SERP BELT 1.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 24.65 *
2825 379462 4/05/18 16112 000 000 94. 02 MAS5153X 6.00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 94.02 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 453.67 * *
01403 FORCE AMERICA, INC I N2001016380  3/26/18 53323 096 463 076 351. 00 DATA PLAN 13. 00
*I NVO CE TOTALS* 351.00 *
*VENDOR TOTALS* 351.00 * *

AGENDA



4/05/18 11:00: 20
VEND# NAME
01635 CRIVITZ AUTO PARTS

01722 SERVE | MPLEMENT MUNI CPAL SALES

03497 MGD | NDUSTRI AL

03510 AI RGAS USA, LLC

H GHWAY COW TTEE APPROVAL REPORT

I NV#
14546 136137

4921

161996

162021

9074304044

9074304325

9074305275

9074305276

DATE
3/ 28/ 18

3/ 29/ 18

3/27/18

3/ 27/ 18

3/ 28/ 18

3/ 28/ 18

3/ 28/ 18

3/ 28/ 18

ACCT# P/SIU OBJ wWr
53220 000 490 000
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*
53240 231BC 453 203
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*
53240 187 453 203
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
53230 000 490 000
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*
53230 000 490 000
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
53230 000 490 000
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
53220 000 490 000
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
53220 000 490 000
*I NVO CE TOTALS*
*VENDOR TOTALS*

* * FINAL TOTALS * *

AGENDA

AMOUNT

21.
21.
21.
120.
120.
120.
83.
83.
366.
366.
449.
149.
149.
139.
139.
41.
41.
163.
163.
493.

129924.

13
13
13
32
32
32
34
34
15
15
49
75
75
95
95
19
19
00
00
89

32

PAGE 4 MHGR2065
| TEM # qQry
PLASTI C CAN 1.00
ROD CLEVI S 1.00
4.5 X7 GRS 1.00

SHOP SUPPLI ES

I NM 25% CDY AR 2.00
ACETYLENE

LI GHT DUTY XL 3.00
OVER HEAD CONSE 10. 00
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