MINIMUM BID

S 500
Sold $1,100

$ 20,000
Sold $31,000.

S 100
Sold $125

$4,000
Sold $7,000

S 250
Sold $250

S 50
Sold $55

$ 6,500
Sold $6,500

S 300
No Bid

$ 8,000
Sold $13,000

DESCRIPTION
TOWN OF AMBERG

T35N-R20E Sec. 6. 0.29 acres. N 15714 Town Corner Lake Rd.
Vacant lot, small shed. Parcel #002-00137.000

T35N-R20E Sec. 22. 18.45 acres. N 14625 USH 141
Old house, outbuildings in poor condition. Parcel #002-00608.000

TOWN OF BEECHER

T36N-R21E Sec. 14. 0.14 acres. Landlocked vacant lot
Parcel #008-00686.001

T36N-R21E Sec. 23. 2.32 acres. N17232 Sand Rd. Small Cabin & shed
fair condition. Parcel #008-00924.001

DUNBAR

T37N-R19E Sec. 30. 0.25 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #010-02088.001

GOODMAN

T37N-R17E Sec. 20. 0.13 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #012-01411.000

TOWN OF NIAGARA

T38N-R20E Sec. 5. 6.87 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #020-00521.001

TOWN OF PEMBINE

T36N-R20E Sec.4. 0.28 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #022-00101.000

TOWN OF PESHTIGO

T30N-R24E Sec. 18. 4.92 acres. N2904 Green Gable Rd. House, shed
poor condition. Parcel #024-01832.000



MINIMUM BID

$ 1,000
Sold $10,000

$ 20,000
Sold $20,000

$ 200
Sold $200

S 500
Sold $500

S 750
Sold $750

$ 1,500
Sold $9,000

S 1,000
Sold $12,000

$ 100
Sold $121

$1,000
Sold $2,000
$ 8,000
Sold $8,000

$2,500
Sold $13,000

S5
Sold $125

DESCRIPTION
TOWN OF PESHTIGO

T30N-R24E Sec. 31. 1.00 acres. Vacant Lot. Parcel #024-01905.002

T30N-R24E Sec. 31. 19.71 acres. Wooded, Vacant, Low.
Parcel #024-01929.000

T31N-R22E Sec. 4. 0.26 acres. Vacant Lot. Parcel #026-00073.000

T31N-R22E Sec. 17. 0.40 acres. Vacant Lot. Parcel #026-00357.000

T31N-R22E Sec. 17. 0.79 acres. Vacant Lot. Parcel #026-01583.000

TOWN OF SILVER CLIFF

T34N-R17E Sec. 25. 1.74 acres. Vacant lot, river frontage.
Parcel #030-02565.000

T34N-R17E Sec. 25. 1.05 acres. Vacant lot, river frontage.
Parcel #030-02575.000

TOWN OF STEPHENSON

T32N-R18E Sec. 14. 0.17 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #032-00463.001

T32N-R19E Sec. 31. 0.99 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #032-01877.000

T32N-R20E Sec. 36. 8.20 acres. Landlocked, low, river frontage
Parcel #032-03081.000

T33N-R19E Sec. 6. 3.44 acres. Vacant wooded lot.
Parcel #032-04385.002

T33N-R19E Sec. 27. 0.01 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #032-05015.000



MINIMUM BID

$ 1,500
Sold $5,000

$ 1,500
Sold $7,000

$ 3,500
Sold $10,000

S 60,000
No Bid

$ 4,000
Sold $4,000

$ 20,000
Sold $36,000

$5
No Bid

$ 3,000
Sold $3,000

S 25
Sold $25

DESCRIPTION
TOWN OF WAGNER

T33N-R22E Sec. 3. 1.16 acres. Vacant, river frontage.
Parcel #034-00258.001

T33N-R22E Sec. 3. 1.25 acres. Vacant, river frontage.
Parcel #034-00258.002

T33N-R22E Sec. 3. 3.24 acres. Vacant, river frontage.
Parcel #034-00258.003

TOWN OF WAUSAUKEE

T33N-R20E Sec. 1. 40.17 acres. W7001 STH 180. Wooded, Low
Cabin & garage in poor condition. Parcel #036-00001.000

T34N-R20E Sec. 22. 6.70 acres. Landlocked, vacant wooded lot
Parcel #036-00989.002

VILLAGE OF CRIVITZ

T32N-R20E Sec. 16. 0.47 acres. 1323 1°" Ave. House, garage
fair condition. Parcel #121-00674.000

VILLAGE OF WAUSAUKEE

T34N-R20E Sec. 36. 0.01 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #191-00540.000

CITY OF MARINETTE

3.59 acres. Vacant, wooded lot, low. Parcel #251-00559.003

0.09 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #251-02378.000



MINIMUM BID DESCRIPTION

CITY OF MARINETTE

S 750 0.20 acres. 800 Pierce Ave. Vacant lot.
No Bid Parcel #251-03632.000

This parcel was identified, in the past, as having contaminated soils. The Wisconsin DNR
monitored and has since closed the site. As a result, there are impervious surface
maintenance and reporting requirements required by the Wisconsin DNR. Copies of this
paperwork can be obtained from the Forestry & Parks Department.

$ 10,000 0.17 acres. 315 Terrace Ave. Old Home, Poor condition
Sold $10,000 Parcel #251-04615.000

S 50 0.18 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #251-04732.000

No Bid

S 25 0.28 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #251-04957.001

Sold $25

S 25 0.36 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #251-05009.001

Sold $225

S 50 0.51 acres. Vacant lot, low. Parcel #251-05138.000
Sold $50

S 150 0.35 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #251-05459.000

Sold $625

S 50 0.03 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #251-05608.000

Sold $300

S 50 0.10 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #251-005620.000

Sold $100

S 8,000 1040 Blaine Street. 0.12 acres. Old home, fair condition.
Sold $9,000 Parcel #251-05890.000

S 100 0.11 acres. Vacant lot. Parcel #251-06190.000

Sold $225



MINIMUM BID

S 750
No Bid

S 3,000
Sold $3,000

S 1,000
No Bid

S 6,000
Sold $12,000

$ 3,000
Sold $37,000

S 2,500
Sold $2,500

$ 1,000
Sold $4,500

S 5,000
No Bid

DESCRIPTION
CITY OF NIAGARA

0.15 acres. 200 Meridian Street. Old home in poor
condition. Parcel #261-00417.000

0.20 acres. 1808 Ridge Street. Old home in poor
condition. Parcel #261-01275.000

0.20 acres. 1856 Ledge Street. Old home and garage
in poor condition. Parcel #261-01333.000

0.17 acres. 1217 Forest Street. Old home in fair condition
Parcel #261-01396.000

TOWN OF BEAVER

1.33 acres. W7291 CTH P. Old home & garage in very poor condition.
Parcel #006-01168.002

3.35 acres. Narrow, vacant strips. Parcel #006-00139.001

1.52 acres. Narrow, vacant strip. Parcel #006-00146.001

TOWN OF DUNBAR

5.94 acres. Narrow, vacant, landlocked strips. Parcel #010-01906.001



