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MINIMUM BID          DESCRIPTION 

TOWN OF AMBERG 

$  15,000  T35N-R21E Sec. 13.  5.78 acres.  N 15189 White Rapids Loop. Older home  
No Bid                             in poor condition.  Parcel #002-01211.000 

TOWN OF ATHELSTANE 

$ 15,000 T35N-R19E Sec. 35.  1.93 acres.  N13805 Mathis Road.  Cabin and garage  
Sold $ 25, 000               in fair condition.  Parcel #004-02348.000 

$   8,000 T34N-R19E Sec. 28.  0.59 acres. N12094 Blueberry Ave.  Cabin in fair  
Sold $ 13,000               condition.  Parcel #004-02554.000 and Parcel #004-02555.000 

TOWN OF BEAVER 

$       100 T31N-R19E Sec. 5  1.42 acres.  Narrow strip.  Parcel #006-00078.001 
Sold $500 

TOWN OF BEECHER 

$   8,000                        T36N-R20E Sec. 22.  2.42 acres.  W7836 Culp Lane.  Mobile home and  
Sold $15,000                garage in poor condition.  Parcel #008-00257.009 

$      750                        T36N-R19E Sec. 23.  0.62 acres.  N17146 Marek Road.  Lot with sheds in  
Sold $4,000                  poor condition.  Parcel #008-00950.009 

$      100                         T36N-R21E Sec. 24.  0.27 acres.  Landlocked vacant lot.     
Sold $110                      Parcel #008-00989.014 

DUNBAR 

$   3,000 T36N-R19E Sec. 2.  2.67 acres.  Wooded lot.  Parcel #010-00410.001 
Sold $13,000 

GOODMAN 

$     500 T36N-R17E Sec. 3.  0.43 acres.  300 Mill Street.  Vacant lot.   
Sold $759                       Parcel #012-02143.000 

$     100 T36N-R17E Sec. 3.  0.17 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #012-02340.000 
Sold $800 
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MINIMUM BID            DESCRIPTION 

TOWN OF NIAGARA 

$      10 T38N-R20E Sec. 17.  0.02 acres.  Landlocked vacant lot.   
Sold $10                         Parcel #020-00601.012 

TOWN OF PEMBINE 

$       50 T37N-R20E Sec.33.  1.00 acres.  Vacant, landlocked lot.  
Sold $300                      Parcel #022-01254.000 

$     500                        T36N-R21E Sec. 5.  0.66 acres.  Vacant wooded lot.     
Sold $1,500                   Parcel #022-06202.000 

TOWN OF PESHTIGO 

$ 10,000 T30N-R23E Sec. 8.  1.25 acres.  N3458 Kozuzek Road.  Mobile home and 
Sold $20,000                 garage in fair condition.  Parcel #024-00895.000 

TOWN OF PORTERFIELD 

$       25 T32N-R22E Sec. 16.  0.09 acres.  Vacant, landlocked.   
Sold $25                        Parcel #026-01061.002    

TOWN OF STEPHENSON 

$     200 T32N-R19E Sec. 31.  2.76 acres.  Narrow strip.  Parcel #032-01870.001 
Sold $200 

$   2,000 T33N-R19E Sec. 20.  1.51 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #032-07018.000 
Sold $8,000 

TOWN OF WAUSAUKEE 

$      150 T34N-R21E Sec. 9.  2.14 acres.  Narrow strip.  Parcel #036-01557.004 
Sold $150 

CITY OF MARINETTE 

$        25                    T30N-R24E Sec. 6.  0.09 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-02378.000 
No Bid 

$      200                   T30N-R24E Sec 6.  0.21 acres.  1002 State Street.  Vacant lot.  
No Bid                             Parcel #251-02498.000 
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MINIMUM BID    DESCRIPTION 

CITY OF MARINETTE CONTINUED 

$   1,000 T30N-R24E Sec. 6.  0.20 acres.  800 Pierce Ave.  Vacant lot.     
No Bid                            Parcel #251-03632.000 

This parcel was identified, in the past, as having contaminated soils.  The Wisconsin DNR 
monitored and has since closed the site.   As a result, there are impervious surface 
maintenance and reporting requirements required by the Wisconsin DNR.  Copies of this 
paperwork can be obtained from the Forestry & Parks Department. 
 
$        50 T30N-R24E Sec. 8.  0.28 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-04957.001 
No Bid 

$        50 T30N-R24E Sec. 8.  0.36 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #251-05009.001 
No Bid 

$ 15,000 T30N-R24E Sec. 8.  0.17 acres.  924 Miller Street.  Old home in fair  
Sold $23,000                 condition.  Parcel #251-05321.000 

$   5,000 T30N-R24E Sec. 6.  0.13 acres.  1036 Blaine Street.  Old home in poor  
Sold $8,500                   condition.  Parcel #251-05891.000 

$   5,000 T30N-R24E Sec. 7.  0.14 acres.  1425 Parnell Street.  Old home in fair 
Sold $21,000                 condition.  Parcel #251-06978.000 

CITY OF NIAGARA 

$       10 T38N-R20E Sec. 15.  0.04 acres.  Vacant, narrow strip.       
Sold $10                        Parcel #261-00110.001 

$   1,000 T38N-R20E Sec. 15.  0.15 acres.  200 Meridian Street.  Old home in poor 
No Bid                            condition.  Parcel #261-00417.000 

$   2,000 T38N-R20E Sec. 15.  0.21 acres.  301 Meridian Street.  Old home in poor 
Sold $2,000                   condition.  Parcel #261-00433.000 

$   1,000 T38N-R20E Sec. 15.  0.20 acres.  1856 Ledge Street.  Old home and garage  
Sold $1,000                   in poor condition.  Parcel #261-01333.000 

$     200 T38N-R20E Sec.15.  0.20 acres.  Vacant lot.  Parcel #261-01335.000 
Sold $1,900 
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